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4 EMERGE_N_ CY MANAGEMENT AGEN CY

- November 9, 2016

Glen Ainsworth
765 Parks Rd Place
Jackson, MS 39212

_Nlr. Ainsworth:

Our office received a Road Incident Claim for a single axle trailer. Unfortunately, after review, the
referenced claim has been denied.

® The location of incident appears to be outside of roadway (to the right of white fog line); cause
of incident was not directly related to roadway deficiency inside the lane of travel,

o {http://madison—co.com/countv—denartments/emerqencvmanaqement/noiicies.php ).

If you have any questions or you feel aggrieved by this decision, you have the right to appeal. All appeals
must go before the Madison County Board of Supervisors during a scheduled Board meeting. You must
contact the Madison County Board of Supervisor’s office and request to be put on the Board’s agenda.

Sincerely,

{ 'V- '

Madison County Emergency Management Agency, Interim Director

601-859-4188 » Fax: 601-859-4743 » 1633 West Peace Strect » Post Office Box 608 » Canton, Mississippi 39046




ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

In order to process the claim, please print & fill out completely and return to Madison Co. EMA office along
with two signed estimates for damages being claimed. All required paperwork must be returned within 7
days of incident. NOTE: Our policy is a reimbursement policy. We DO NOT replace nor arrange to have any

repairs made. It is to your own discretion to when the repairs are made. If your claim is approved a
reimbursement check will mailed to you at the given address given below.

Personal

Information

Date:
_10/25/2016

Name: _Jonathan Glen
Ainsworth

Mailing Address:
__ 765 Parks Rd Place ___

Jackson, MS
39212

Contact #: _601-842-3385

Make/ Model of Vehicle: __Single Axle
Trailer ‘

Incident

Information

Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being
reported:

Date: 10/06/2016 Time: 3:30-4:00pm

Location: __ Catlett Rd

(name of road incident occurred)

Area Landmarks: ___ Near Lake
Caroline

Approx. Speed at time of incident: _35 MPH

Direction of Travel: __Towards the
interstate

Cause of Incident: Pothole
(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)

Area of vehicle damaged: Tire, Rim and
Axle
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Incident

Summary

Please write a brief summary of the incident (use back if needed):

|

o pdund| ke
I pulled out of Léke' Caroline onto Catlett Rd heading towards the
interstate when I hit a pothole that immediately bent my rim and
popped the tire on the trailer I was pulling behind my truck.
There was a Madison County SO behind me that saw what
happened and pulled in behind me. He wrote me a case number
and said that I would be reimbursed for the damages.

When I took my trailer to get a new rim and tire I was informed
that my axle had been bent and it would need to be replaced as
well.
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Jennifer Taxlor

From: Dan Gaillet

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2016 1:28 PM
To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Best we can tell, he ran off the road (out of bounds).

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2016 4:10 PM

To: Dan Gaillet <Dan.Gaillet@madison-co.com>; Amber Pope <Amber.Pope@madison-co.com>; Helen Keller
<hkeller@madison-co.com>

Subject: Road Claim

We received a road claim on Catlett at Stribling Rd. The original call came in last week, but just received his
paperwork. It broke the guys trailer axle and bent his rim pretty good.

Madison County Emergency Management/ E-911 Admin
1633 W. Peace Street

Canton, MS 39046

T: 601-855-5620

F: 601-859-4743




Jennifer Taylor
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From: Dan Gaillet
Sent: Tuesday, November 08, 2016 1:06 PM
To: Jennifer Taylor
Subject: Re; Road Claim

We are going to stick to our story that he had to be off the road. We've fixed a hole outside of the white line.
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 8, 2016, at 12:31 PM, Jennifer Taylor <Jennifer.Taylor@madison-co.com> wrote:

Hey. Checking on this. | have got to move forward with his claim tomorrow.

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2016 1:39 PM
To: Dan Gaillet

Cc: Amber Pope

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Hey. Wanted to follow up on this because we are just getting additional information, one being
the exact location. This is the area just south of Red Fox on west side. | am sure we are
talking about the same spot. However there is a police report that states it is “just” inside of
fog line. I am going to base it on your decision, but wanted to be sure in light of the police
report and make sure it IS indeed out of bounds. Can you let me know one way or another
please sir. Again, we are going to go off your decision.

Jen

From: Dan Gaillet

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2016 1:28 PM
Ta: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Best we can tell, he ran off the road (out of bounds).

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2016 4:10 PM

To: Dan Gaillet <Dan.Gaillet@madison-co.com>; Amber Pope <Amber.Pope@madison-co.com>; Helen
Keller <hkeller@madison-co.com>

Subject: Road Claim

We received a road claim on Catlett at Stribling Rd. The original call came in last week, but
just received his paperwork. It broke the guys trailer axle and bent his rim pretty good.

Jennifer Canpenter




Jennifer Tazlor

From: Amber Pope

Sent: Tuesday, November 08, 2016 1.01 PM
To: Jennifer Taylor; Dan Gaillet

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Just checked with Cornelius, that hole was outside the fog line

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, November 08, 2016 12:32 PM
To: Dan Gaillet

Cc: Amber Pope

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Hey. Checking on this. I have got to move forward with his claim tomorrow.

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2016 1:39 PM
To: Dan Gaillet

Cc: Amber Pope

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Hey. Wanted to follow up on this because we are just getting additional information, one being the exact
location. This is the area just south of Red Fox on west side. | am sure we are talking about the same spot.
However there is a police report that states it is “just” inside of fog line. I am going to base it on your
decision, but wanted to be sure in light of the police report and make sure it IS indeed out of bounds. Can
you let me know one way or another please sir. Again, we are going to go off your decision.

Jen

From: Dan Gaillet

Sent: Wednesday, October 19, 2016 1:28 PM
To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: RE: Road Claim

Best we can tell, he ran off the road (out of bounds).

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2016 4:10 PM

To: Dan Gaillet <Dan.Gaillet@madison-co.com>; Amber Pope <Amber.Pope @madison-co.com>; Helen Keller
<hkeller@madison-co.com>

Subject: Road Claim

We received a road claim on Catlett at Stribling Rd. The original call came in last week, but just received his
paperwork. It broke the guys trailer axle and bent his rim pretty good.




Jennifer Taylor
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From: Jennifer Taylor
Sent: Tuesday, October 18, 2016 12:09 PM
To: 'Glen Ainsworth'
Subject: RE: road claim inquiry

[ received your quotes and pictures, but I do not have the incident form. Can you please forward that to
me.

Jennifer

From: Glen Ainsworth [mailto:glenms85@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, October 10, 2016 11:07 AM

To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: Re: road claim inquiry

On Oct 6, 2016 2:32 PM, "Jennifer Taylor" <Jennifer. Taylor@madison-co.com> wrote:

Please fill the attached form out completely and return to our office, along with 2 signed estimates and any
pictures of road or vehicle damage. This MUST be returned to our office within 7 working days of incident per
policy.

Should you have any questions, please contact the office at the information below.

Thank you,

Jennifer Canpenter

Madison County Emergency Management/ E-911 Admin
1633 W. Peace Street

Canton, MS 39046

T: 601-855-5620

F: 601-859-4743




Staring Trailer Sales
6765 155 South

Invoice

Date Invoice #
Byram, MS 39272
601-373-1615 10/10/2016 6640
www.trailerbuy.com
Bill To Ship To
Cash Customer
Glean Answorth
P.0O. Number Terms Rep Ship Via F.O.B. Project
cash Due on receipt BQ 10/10/2016
Quantity ltem Code Description Price Each Anount
| | Non-Inventory 91576 axle 149.00 149.00T
I | Non-Inventory 3.5k ubolt kit 12,50 12.50T
11 AADO8T 60Benny Harrison 60.00 60.00T
Sales Tax 7.00% 15.51
L % Office of the Sheriff |
$ i Madison County, Mississippi ‘
2941 Highway 51 ® Canton, Mississippi 39046
Randall Tucker, Sheriff’
Joel Evans i
Patrol Division |
Deputy Sheriff S0-37 I
Case no._&"_ﬁm el -
Office: (601) 859-2345 Toll Free: 1-877-736-2883
Jackson: (601) 355-0379 Fax: (601) 859-6764
Total $237.01




Staring Trailer Sales

6765155 South

Estimate

Byram, MS 39272 Date Estimate #
001-373-1615 10/10/2016 1917
\-\*‘\-\:"W’.[l'ﬂl]El‘hU y.com
Name / Address
Cash Customer
glen answorth
Project
Description Qty Rate Total
I3 in tire & wheel 160.00 160.00T
Subtotal $160.00
Sales Tax (7.0%) $11.20

Total

$171.20




" Gluckstadt Trailer & Equipient Co,

2221 Hwy 51 Madison. MS 39110

Phone 601-859-5958
INVOICE
Aggme: Ka/lof’] 947946‘&/0/“%%) /ﬂ /ﬂ ﬁ/&
ess - Invoice No. (7 T/ ﬂ/ éﬂzj’?/
Phone:
fiate Descﬁpfiﬂn Charge
Son 7’/22[_ 7Lr\/‘c "/”__M)Zfz"fl)aﬁsy "'&}g?ﬁzz_

T

9.9D

_{Subtotal

Previous Bal

4. 75

Total

CNES




Gluckstadt Trailer & Equipment Co.
2221 Hwy 51 Madison, MS 39110
Phone 601 -859-5958

&
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Buyer's Order ]

vame: (5 b, AL My, f?% Orderbate: /) -/, ‘"‘// 4

Address:
Delivery Date: _y,r/ ‘37ID(,
Phone:
Modei | Description Price

W7 25K axle ?/5955
38U bolt L)+ $19.95

L alor 4 s )

450,00

Prices good for 15 days and on in stock inventory only unless spacified in order. -

Subtotal | 229.9D

All warraniies are as per manéfécturé‘r‘s description. Ali claims should be submitied  |Sales Tax /LD 9’
i P

o the manufacturer. Glucksiaéit Tradtm & Trailer Go. is not responsible for defecis in Freight

materials or workmanship or ct'amage‘due 10 misuse orahuse. Total ‘2 %; / ﬁ z










